

August 10, 2017

BOARD MATTER E-6

**ACTION:** Consider Results of the July 19, 2017 State of Wyoming Oil and Gas Lease Auction

**AUTHORITY:** W.S. § 36-6-101; Board of Land Commissioners' Rules and Regulations, Chapter 18, Section 5

**ALTERNATIVES:**

- Approve Wyoming Oil and Gas Lease Auction Results
- Deny Wyoming Oil and Gas Lease Auction Results

**ANALYSIS:**

An auction for the sale of State of Wyoming Oil and Gas Leases was held via EnergyNet.com from July 12, 2017 through July 19, 2017. Two hundred and forty parcels were initially prepared; no parcels were withdrawn from the auction. Of the 240 parcels offered for lease at the auction, 127 were successfully bid upon.

Of the 240 parcels offered at the auction, 151 were offered at 16 2/3% royalty rate and 89 were offered at 12 1/2% royalty rate. Total lease bonus for the sale was \$14,067,425.49. Total auction revenue was \$14,134,883.76. Out of 85,960.71 acres originally prepared for the auction, 85,960.71 acres were offered, and 49,265.49 acres were successfully bid upon.

In accordance with the Office of State Lands and Investments' existing coordination process with the Wyoming Game and Fish Department and the Wyoming State Historic Preservation Office, Standard Stipulations have been recommended for the auctioned oil and gas leases. The stipulation numbers for each lease are included in the auction results (see attachment). The specific language of all Standard Stipulations can be found at:

<http://slf-web.state.wy.us/MLease/auctions/stipulations.pdf>.

**DIRECTOR'S RECOMMENDATION:**

The Director recommends the Board approve the results of the July 19, 2017 State of Wyoming Oil and Gas Lease Auction as described in the attachment by issuing the respective leases with an effective date of August 2, 2017 to the successful bidders on the current oil and gas lease form, including the specified Standard Stipulations.

**BOARD ACTION:** Board Approved

## Auction Results

Auction Date: July 19, 2017

Board of Land Commissioners

State Of Wyoming Office of State Lands and Investments- Results of the online oil and gas lease auction

Parcel #	County	Section	Township	Range	Acres	Fund Code	Stipulations	Lessee	Bonus Per Acre	Lease #	Total Due \$	Royalty Rate %
1	Laramie	Sec 8 N2	T12N	R60W	320.00	CS	1, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00223	\$1,368.40	16.67
2	Laramie	Sec 16 All	T12N	R61W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Extraction Oil & Gas	\$ 604.00	17-00224	\$387,326.80	16.67
3	Laramie	Sec 36 All	T13N	R61W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00225	\$2,046.80	16.67
4	Niobrara	Sec 16 All	T39N	R64W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 50.00	17-00226	\$32,766.80	16.67
5	Niobrara	Sec 36 All	T39N	R64W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 31.00	17-00227	\$20,606.80	16.67
6	Niobrara	Sec 34 SWNW:W2SW:SESW:SWSE	T41N	R64W	200.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 21.00	17-00228	\$4,474.00	16.67
7	Niobrara	Sec 36 All	T41N	R64W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 111.00	17-00229	\$71,806.80	16.67
8	Weston	Sec 16 All	T44N	R64W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 4.00	17-00230	\$3,326.80	16.67
9	Weston	Sec 17 SESE	T44N	R64W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00231	\$334.80	16.67
10	Weston	Sec 20 NENE	T44N	R64W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 16.00	17-00232	\$734.80	16.67
11	Weston	Sec 21 N2NW	T44N	R64W	80.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 13.00	17-00233	\$1,179.60	16.67
12	Niobrara	Sec 16 All	T39N	R65W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 31.00	17-00234	\$20,606.80	16.67
13	Weston	Sec 5 Lot 2:SWNE:SENE	T41N	R65W	120.58	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 31.00	17-00235	\$3,936.52	16.67
14	Weston	Sec 16 All	T41N	R65W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 33.00	17-00236	\$21,886.80	16.67

15	Niobrara	Sec 36 All	T41N	R65W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Sunshine Valley Petroleum Corporation	\$ 36.00	17-00237	\$23,806.80	16.67
16	Niobrara	Sec 36 All	T33N	R66W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Perkins Oil and Gas Inc	\$ 1.00	17-00238	\$1,406.80	16.67
17	Niobrara	Sec 36 All	T34N	R67W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 13.00	17-00239	\$9,086.80	16.67
18	Crook	Sec 29 SWNE:E2NW:NWSE	T55N	R67W	160.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Azalea Oil Company, LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00240	\$389.20	16.67
19	Converse	Sec 34 E2	T35N	R70W	320.00	FL	1, 136	PRB Operating Capital I LLC	\$ 6,103.00	17-00241	\$1,953,368.40	16.67
20	Converse	Sec 35 W2	T35N	R70W	320.00	FL	1, 117, 136	PRB Operating Capital I LLC	\$ 6,103.00	17-00242	\$1,953,368.40	16.67
21	Converse	Sec 14 SENE	T35N	R71W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136	PRB Operating Capital I LLC	\$ 6,103.00	17-00243	\$244,214.80	16.67
22	Campbell	Trt 49 A-C (formerly NWNE:N2NW Sec 21)	T57N	R71W	120.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Knapp Oil Corporation	\$ 1.00	17-00244	\$304.40	16.67
23	Campbell	Trt 51 A-B (formerly NENE Sec 19; NWNW Sec 20)	T57N	R71W	80.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Knapp Oil Corporation	\$ 1.00	17-00245	\$219.60	16.67
24	Converse	Sec 4 SESW:W2SE	T36N	R72W	120.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 851.00	17-00246	\$102,304.40	16.67
25	Converse	Sec 7 Lot 1:NENE	T36N	R72W	88.07	CS	1, 136	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 1,101.00	17-00247	\$98,138.68	16.67
26	Converse	Sec 9 NENW	T36N	R72W	40.00	CS	1, 136	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 1,251.00	17-00248	\$50,134.80	16.67
27	Converse	Sec 36 All	T37N	R72W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 3,004.00	17-00249	\$1,923,326.80	16.67
28	Converse	Sec 11 NESW:NWSE	T38N	R72W	80.00	CS	1, 136	Titan Exploration, LLC	\$ 4,800.00	17-00250	\$384,139.60	16.67
29	Campbell	Sec 36 E2	T49N	R72W	320.00	CS	1, 136	Grey Wolf Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00251	\$1,368.40	16.67
30	Campbell	Sec 16 All	T54N	R72W	640.00	CS	136, 1	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 7.00	17-00252	\$5,246.80	16.67
31	Campbell	Sec 36 All	T57N	R72W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Maurice W. Brown Oil & Gas, LLC	\$ 101.00	17-00253	\$65,406.80	16.67

32	Converse	Sec 5 Lots 1-2:S2NE	T38N	R74W	158.03	CS	1, 136	Titan Exploration, LLC	\$ 4,211.00	17-00254	\$669,777.08	16.67
33	Converse	Sec 8 W2SW	T38N	R75W	80.00	CS	1, 117, 136	K2T2 Resources LLC	\$ 4,001.00	17-00255	\$320,219.60	16.67
34	Converse	Sec 17 N2NW	T38N	R75W	80.00	CS	1, 117, 136	K2T2 Resources LLC	\$ 4,001.00	17-00256	\$320,219.60	16.67
35	Converse	Sec 32 SWSW	T41N	R75W	40.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Titan Exploration, LLC	\$ 4,451.00	17-00257	\$178,134.80	16.67
36	Campbell	Sec 16 All	T42N	R75W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Titan Exploration, LLC	\$ 6,302.00	17-00258	\$4,034,046.80	16.67
37	Converse	Trt 50 A-H (formerlySec 3Lots 1-4:S2NW:N2SW)	T32N	R76W	299.21	DD	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
38	Converse	Trt 51 A:F-G (formerlySec 2 NESW:S2SW)	T32N	R76W	120.00	PE	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
39	Converse	Trt 54 (formerlySec 2Lots 1-2:S2NE:N2SE)	T32N	R76W	230.24	DD	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
40	Converse	Sec 5 Lot 4	T38N	R76W	39.08	CS	1, 117, 136	Wold Energy Partners	\$ 712.00	17-00259	\$28,574.80	16.67
41	Campbell	Sec 11 SWSW:SWSE	T41N	R76W	80.00	CS	1, 136	Titan Exploration, LLC	\$ 6,000.00	17-00260	\$480,139.60	16.67
42	Johnson	Sec 13 SWNE	T44N	R82W	40.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
43	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T33N	R86W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
44	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T33N	R86W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Robert L Bayless, Producer LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00261	\$1,406.80	16.67
45	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T34N	R86W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00262	\$1,406.80	16.67
46	Natrona	Sec 26 NENE	T34N	R86W	40.00	CS	1, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 4.00	17-00263	\$254.80	16.67
47	Natrona	Sec 29 NENE	T34N	R86W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 4.00	17-00264	\$254.80	16.67
48	Carbon	Sec 7 NENW	T26N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5

49	Carbon	Sec 14 SENE:NESE	T26N	R87W	80.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
50	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T26N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
51	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T27N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
52	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T27N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
53	Carbon	Sec 3 Lots 3-4	T28N	R87W	87.15	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
54	Carbon	Sec 14 SWSW	T28N	R87W	40.00	IA	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
55	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T28N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
56	Carbon	Sec 23 NWNW	T28N	R87W	40.00	IA	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
57	Carbon	Sec 29 NESE	T28N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
58	Natrona	Sec 2 SWSW	T29N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
59	Natrona	Sec 16 N2:SW:S2SE	T29N	R87W	560.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
60	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T29N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 57, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
61	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T30N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
62	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T30N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
63	Natrona	Sec 3 SWNW	T33N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00265	\$134.80	16.67
64	Natrona	Sec 15 SESW:W2SE	T33N	R87W	120.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00266	\$304.40	16.67
65	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T33N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67

66	Natrona	Sec 21 SESW:SWSE	T33N	R87W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00267	\$219.60	16.67
67	Natrona	Sec 22 NENW	T33N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00268	\$134.80	16.67
68	Natrona	Sec 28 NENW	T33N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00269	\$134.80	16.67
69	Natrona	Sec 31 SWSE	T33N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 136	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00270	\$134.80	16.67
70	Natrona	Sec 32 SESW	T33N	R87W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Adams Minerals	\$ 2.00	17-00271	\$174.80	16.67
71	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T33N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
72	Natrona	Sec 28 SENE:NESE	T34N	R87W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00272	\$219.60	16.67
73	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T34N	R87W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
74	Natrona	Sec 16 S2	T35N	R87W	320.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00273	\$728.40	16.67
75	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T24N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00274	\$1,406.80	12.5
76	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T24N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
77	Carbon	Sec 9 SWNW:N2S2	T26N	R88W	200.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
78	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T26N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
79	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T26N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Richardson Production Company	\$ 1.00	17-00275	\$1,406.80	12.5
80	Carbon	Sec 2 W2W2	T27N	R88W	160.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
81	Carbon	Sec 4 SWNE:SWSW:NWSE	T27N	R88W	120.00	IA	1, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
82	Carbon	Sec 10 E2E2	T27N	R88W	160.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5

83	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T27N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
84	Carbon	Sec 17 SENW	T27N	R88W	40.00	MH	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
85	Carbon	Sec 18 SWNE	T27N	R88W	40.00	MH	1, 117, 136	Adams Minerals	\$ 1.00	17-00276	\$134.80	12.5
86	Carbon	Sec 30 NWNE	T27N	R88W	40.00	MH	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
87	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T27N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
88	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T28N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
89	Carbon	Sec 23 W2SE	T28N	R88W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
90	Carbon	Sec 30 E2SW	T28N	R88W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
91	Carbon	Sec 31 Lots 1-2	T28N	R88W	61.03	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
92	Natrona	Sec 14 E2	T29N	R88W	320.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
93	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T29N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
94	Natrona	Sec 17 SWSW	T29N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 130, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
95	Natrona	Sec 18 NWSE:SESE	T29N	R88W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 130, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
96	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T30N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
97	Natrona	Sec 23 SE	T30N	R88W	160.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
98	Natrona	Sec 24 SW	T30N	R88W	160.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
99	Natrona	Sec 25 NW	T30N	R88W	160.00	CS	1, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5

100	Natrona	Sec 27 SWNW:W2SW	T30N	R88W	120.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
101	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T30N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
102	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T34N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
103	Natrona	Sec 33 SESW:SWSE	T34N	R88W	80.00	CS	1, 136	KKREP,LLC	\$ 1.00	17-00277	\$219.60	16.67
104	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T34N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
105	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T35N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00278	\$1,406.80	16.67
106	Natrona	Sec 25 SWNE	T35N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00279	\$134.80	16.67
107	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T35N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00280	\$1,406.80	16.67
108	Natrona	Sec 9 SWNE:SEW:NESW:NWSE	T36N	R88W	160.00	MH	1, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00281	\$389.20	16.67
109	Natrona	Sec 12 SENE	T36N	R88W	40.00	SR	1, 5, 117, 136	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00282	\$134.80	16.67
110	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T36N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 1.00	17-00283	\$1,406.80	16.67
111	Natrona	Sec 1 SWSE	T39N	R88W	40.00	AG	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
112	Natrona	Sec 2 Lot 3	T39N	R88W	35.32	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
113	Natrona	Sec 6 Lot 1	T39N	R88W	33.26	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
114	Natrona	Sec 12 SWNE	T39N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
115	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T39N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
116	Natrona	Sec 29 SESE	T39N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67



117	Natrona	Sec 1 W2SW	T40N	R88W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
118	Natrona	Sec 11 NENE	T40N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
119	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T40N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
120	Natrona	Sec 19 NENE:E2NW	T40N	R88W	120.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
121	Natrona	Sec 32 NWSW	T40N	R88W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
122	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T40N	R88W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
123	Carbon	Sec 1 Lots 3-4	T24N	R89W	80.96	CS	1, 5, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00284	\$221.72	12.5
124	Carbon	Sec 6 Lots 1-7:S2NE:SE:SW:SE	T24N	R89W	621.84	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00285	\$1,368.64	12.5
125	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T24N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
126	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T25N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00286	\$2,046.80	12.5
127	Carbon	Sec 2 Lots 1-4:S2N2	T26N	R89W	323.16	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
128	Carbon	Sec 5 SWSE	T27N	R89W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
129	Carbon	Sec 8 N2NW	T27N	R89W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
130	Carbon	Sec 18 NESW:N2SE	T27N	R89W	120.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
131	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T27N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
132	Carbon	Sec 16 All	T28N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
133	Carbon	Sec 26 NENW:W2SW	T28N	R89W	120.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5

134	Carbon	Sec 32 NWNW:NESW	T28N	R89W	80.00	MH	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
135	Carbon	Sec 36 All	T28N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
136	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T29N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
137	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T29N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
138	Natrona	Sec 16 All	T30N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
139	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T30N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
140	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T34N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kenneth Farmer	\$ 1.00	17-00287	\$1,406.80	16.67
141	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T34N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
142	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T35N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Anderson Oil Ltd.	\$ 2.00	17-00288	\$2,046.80	16.67
143	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T36N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00289	\$2,686.80	16.67
144	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T36N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00290	\$2,046.80	16.67
145	Fremont	Sec 31 Lots 1-7	T37N	R89W	284.22	DD	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00291	\$2,079.20	16.67
146	Fremont	Sec 31 NENE:E2W2	T37N	R89W	200.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00292	\$1,474.00	16.67
147	Natrona	Sec 36 All	T38N	R89W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00293	\$4,606.80	16.67
148	Natrona	Sec 15 SWNE	T39N	R89W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
149	Natrona	Sec 36 Lots 1-4:N2:N2S2	T39N	R89W	581.36	CS	1, 5, 57, 117, 136	Curtis Breckon	\$ 1.00	17-00294	\$1,283.84	16.67
150	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T35N	R90W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00295	\$1,406.80	16.67

151	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T36N	R90W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00296	\$2,686.80	16.67
152	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T20N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Southland Royalty Company LLC	\$ 251.00	17-00297	\$161,406.80	16.67
153	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T25N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00298	\$1,406.80	16.67
154	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T25N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00299	\$1,406.80	16.67
155	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T35N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00300	\$1,406.80	16.67
156	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T35N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00301	\$2,046.80	16.67
157	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T36N	R91W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00302	\$2,686.80	16.67
158	Fremont	Sec 19 S2	T37N	R91W	320.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00303	\$2,328.40	16.67
159	Fremont	Sec 20 NE:S2	T37N	R91W	480.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00304	\$3,467.60	16.67
160	Fremont	Sec 21 NW:S2	T37N	R91W	480.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00305	\$3,467.60	16.67
161	Fremont	Sec 9 S2SW:NESW:SWSE	T38N	R91W	160.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00306	\$389.20	16.67
162	Fremont	Sec 6 SENW	T39N	R91W	40.00	CS	1, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
163	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T35N	R92W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00307	\$1,406.80	16.67
164	Fremont	Sec 34 NESW	T35N	R92W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00308	\$134.80	16.67
165	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T35N	R92W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00309	\$1,406.80	16.67
166	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T36N	R92W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 5.00	17-00310	\$3,966.80	16.67
167	Fremont	Sec 7 S2NE	T37N	R92W	80.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00311	\$219.60	16.67

168	Fremont	Sec 23 N2	T37N	R92W	320.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 4.00	17-00312	\$1,688.40	16.67
169	Fremont	Sec 24 N2:SE	T37N	R92W	480.00	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 4.00	17-00313	\$2,507.60	16.67
170	Fremont	Sec 12 Lots 3-6:SWNE:NESW:NWSE	T38N	R92W	220.40	CS	1, 117, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00314	\$739.52	16.67
171	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T24N	R93W	640.00	CS	1, 133, 136, 145	Southland Royalty Company LLC	\$ 202.00	17-00315	\$130,046.80	16.67
172	Fremont	Sec 10 SW	T35N	R93W	160.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00316	\$709.20	16.67
173	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T35N	R93W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 6.00	17-00317	\$4,606.80	16.67
174	Fremont	Sec 23 S2	T35N	R93W	320.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 2.00	17-00318	\$1,048.40	16.67
175	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T35N	R93W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 3.00	17-00319	\$2,686.80	16.67
176	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T36N	R93W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 10.00	17-00320	\$7,166.80	16.67
177	Sweetwater	Sec 4 E2SE	T26N	R94W	80.00	IA	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
178	Sweetwater	Sec 8 S2NE:NESW:S2SW:NWSE	T26N	R94W	240.00	IA	1, 57, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
179	Sweetwater	Sec 9 NWNE:N2NW:SWNW	T26N	R94W	160.00	IA	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
180	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T26N	R94W	640.00	CS	1, 57, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
181	Sweetwater	Sec 18 Lot 4:N2NE:SWNE:E2SW	T26N	R94W	240.77	IA	1, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
182	Sweetwater	Sec 31 Lots 1-3:NENW	T26N	R94W	160.69	IA	1, 117, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00321	\$391.32	16.67
183	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T26N	R94W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 1.00	17-00322	\$1,406.80	16.67
184	Fremont	Sec 16 All	T36N	R94W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 7.00	17-00323	\$5,246.80	16.67

185	Fremont	Sec 36 All	T36N	R94W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Kirkwood Oil & Gas	\$ 12.00	17-00324	\$8,446.80	16.67
186	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T16N	R96W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Southland Royalty Company LLC	\$ 302.00	17-00325	\$194,046.80	16.67
187	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T21N	R96W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Foundation Energy Management, LLC	\$ 102.00	17-00326	\$66,046.80	16.67
188	Sweetwater	Sec 1 Lot 1	T13N	R98W	40.08	CS	1, 136, 145	R. C. Michael Company, Inc.	\$ 150.00	17-00327	\$6,245.92	16.67
189	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T14N	R99W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Baseline Minerals, Inc.	\$ 56.00	17-00328	\$36,606.80	16.67
190	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T19N	R107W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00329	\$1,406.80	16.67
191	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T20N	R107W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00330	\$1,406.80	16.67
192	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T20N	R107W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00331	\$1,406.80	16.67
193	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T21N	R107W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00332	\$1,406.80	16.67
194	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T21N	R107W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00333	\$1,406.80	16.67
195	Sweetwater	Sec 8 Lots 1-4:NWNE:S2N2:Green River Bed	T19N	R108W	320.00	MH	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00334	\$728.40	16.67
196	Sweetwater	Sec 22 N2N2	T19N	R108W	160.00	MH	1, 5, 117, 136	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00335	\$389.20	16.67
197	Sweetwater	Sec 36 Lots 1-8:N2NE:SENE:SWNW:W2SW:SESW:SWSE	T19N	R108W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00336	\$1,406.80	16.67
198	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T20N	R108W	640.00	CS	1, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00337	\$1,406.80	16.67
199	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T20N	R108W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00338	\$1,406.80	16.67
200	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T21N	R108W	640.00	CS	1, 136	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00339	\$1,406.80	16.67
201	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T21N	R108W	640.00	CS	1, 117, 136, 145	Farleigh Oil Properties	\$ 1.00	17-00340	\$1,406.80	16.67

202	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T22N	R110W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
203	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T22N	R110W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
204	Sweetwater	Sec 36 All	T23N	R110W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 136	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
205	Sweetwater	Sec 16 All	T24N	R110W	640.00	CS	1, 5, 130, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	16.67
206	Lincoln	Sec 5 NWNE	T25N	R114W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
207	Lincoln	Sec 6 SENW	T25N	R114W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 136, 145	Crest Resources, Inc.	\$ 1.00	17-00341	\$134.80	12.5
208	Lincoln	Sec 17 NESW:NWSE	T25N	R114W	80.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5
209	Lincoln	Sec 18 SWSE	T25N	R114W	40.00	CS	1, 5, 117, 136, 145	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00	12.5